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  Please check with your telephone supplier. 

 

 
 
• The super efficient mop 

pad is machine washable 
and easily removed for 
cleaning. Wash the pad at 
30 °C and air dry after. 

• Please do not leave the 
mop on your floor when it 
is wet to avoid possible 
staining to flooring. 

• Please air the mop cloth 
after each use. 

• Replace the mop cloth if 
worn and to prevent 
colour fading. 

• Please keep water source 
clean to prevent any 
debris jamming in the 
sprayer. Do not use a 
thick cleaning liquid as 
this causes build up in the 
spray nozzle. 

• The pad is held on to the 
mop head with hook and 
loop technology and can 
be removed and replaced 
when needed. 

http://www.coopersofstortford.co.uk/
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DISPOSAL 
• Coopers of Stortford use recyclable or recycled packaging where possible. 
• Please dispose of all packaging, paper, cartons, packaging in accordance with your local 

recycling regulations.  
• Plastics, polybags – Contains the following recyclable plastic. 
 

 

Code & Symbol 

 

Type of Plastic ABS 

Commonly used for 
CD’s, crisp packets, various flexible packaging, baby 

bottles, sunglass lenses 

Notes Not often or widely recycled 

 
• At the end of the product’s lifespan please check with your local council authorised household waste 

recycling centre for disposal. 

http://www.coopersofstortford.co.uk/

